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GROUP 1 [MINI BUS UNIT
2 ea. PRICE 475.00 NO BID
1. MINI-BUS 29 PASSENGER 4 HR, Lawson No. 22787 TOTAL 950.00
UNIT
2 ea. PRICE 575.00 NO BID
2. MINI-BUS 29 PASSENGER 5 HR, Lawson No. 22788 TOTAL 1,150.00
UNIT
1ea. PRICE 675.00 NO BID
3. MINI-BUS 29 PASSENGER 6 HR, Lawson No. 22789 TOTAL 675.00
UNIT
2 ea. PRICE 775.00 NO BID
4. MINI-BUS 29 PASSENGER 7 HR, Lawson No. 22790 TOTAL 1,550.00
UNIT
1ea. PRICE 875.00 NO BID
5. MINI-BUS 29 PASSENGER 8 HR, Lawson No. 33998 TOTAL 875.00
UNIT
1ea. PRICE 975.00 NO BID
6. MINI-BUS 29 PASSENGER 9 HR, Lawson No. 22792 TOTAL 975.00
Sub Total for Group 1 TOTAL 6,175.00 NO BID
GROUP 2 [PASSENGER BUSS 55 LARGER UNIT
1ea. PRICE 600.00 498.75
1. PASSENGER BUS 55 or LARGER 3 HR., Lawson No. 33968 TOTAL 600.00 498.75
UNIT
1ea. PRICE 600.00 498.75
2. PASSENGER BUSs 55 or LARGER 5 HR., Lawson No. 33999 TOTAL 600.00 498.75
UNIT
1ea. PRICE 725.00 598.50
3. PASSENGER BUS 55 or LARGER 6 HR., Lawson No. 22797 TOTAL 725.00 598.50
UNIT
1ea. PRICE 850.00 698.25
4. PASSENGER BUS 55 or LARGER 7 HR., Lawson No. 34000 TOTAL 850.00 698.25
UNIT
12 ea. PRICE 975.00 798.00
5. PASSENGER BUS-55 or LARGER 8 HR., Lawson No. 34001 TOTAL 11,700.00 9,576.00
UNIT
1ea. PRICE 1,100.00 897.75
6. PASSENGER BUS-55 or LARGER 9 HR., Lawson No. 34002 TOTAL 1,100.00 897.75
Sub Total for Group 2 TOTAL 15,575.00 12,768.00
GROUP 3|ADDITIONAL HOUR UNIT
Hour PRICE
1. MINI BUS 29 PASSENGER - HOUSLY RATE PER ADDITIONAL HOUR, Lawson No. 31312 TOTAL 100.00 N/A
UNIT
Hour PRICE
2. PASSENGER BUS 55 LARGER - HOURLY RATE PER ADDITIONAL HOUR, Lawson No. 31311 |TOTAL 125.00 99.75
Sub Total for Group 3 TOTAL 225.00 99.75
*
GRAND TOTAL TOTAL 21,975.00
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EXTENSION 1 21,975.00
EXTENSION 2 21,975.00
EXTENSION 3 21,975.00
Net Net
Terms 30 days 30 days
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
City Tours, Inc. Regent Coachline SAWS Website
Coach USA Star Shuttle
Daisy Tours Star Shuttle
Imperial BUS Tuxedo Charters

Kerrville BUS Co.
OK Tours

Valley Transit Co.




